
Page 1 of 4 
 

ORDINANCE 2010-9 
 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE  
ICC INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2006 EDITION 

 
 

 WHEREAS, the Village of Pecatonica (“Village”) has adopted the 2006 edition of 
the ICC International Fire Code (“Fire Code”); and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Village desires to amend sections of said Fire Code; and 
   

WHEREAS, the Village finds that it is in the best interest of the Village and its 
citizens to amend sections of the Fire Code so that the Fire Code better meets the 
needs and requirements of the Village; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Village is authorized and empowered by statute to amend and 

enforce the provisions of this Ordinance. 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE PRESIDENT AND THE 
VILLAGE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE VILLAGE OF PECATONICA, 
WINNEBAGO COUNTY, ILLINOIS, AS FOLLOWS: 
 
Section 1. The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as findings of the 
Pecatonica Board of Trustees.  
 
Section 2. That the following sections of the ICC International Fire Code, 2006 
Edition, are amended as follows:  See attached schedule of changes attached hereto as 
Exhibit A and incorporated by reference herein. 
 
Section 3. To the extent this Ordinance contradicts any previous orders, resolutions, 
ordinances or parts of orders, resolutions and ordinances of the Village, this Ordinance 
shall control and all other orders, resolutions, ordinances or parts of orders, resolutions, 
and ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed insofar as such conflicts exist. 
 
Section 4. All other orders, resolutions ordinances or parts of orders, resolutions, and 
ordinances of the Village of Pecatonica, Illinois not in conflict with this Ordinance shall 
remain in full force and effect. 
 
Section 5. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, 
approval and publication in pamphlet form as provided by law.  This Ordinance shall be 
published in pamphlet form. 
 
 
 
 
 



Page 2 of 4 
 

PASSED by the Village Board this ____ day of _________, 2010. 
 

APPROVED by the President of the Village Board this ____ day of __________, 
2010. 

 
__________________________ 
Shawn Connors 
President of the Board of Trustees of   

       the Village of Pecatonica, IL   
ATTEST: 
 
___________________________ 
Ginger Binger, Village Clerk 
 
Ayes: ___   Nays: ___   Absent: ___ 
     
Tarbert:  _____  Howard: _____  Eytalis: _____ 
Moyer: _____  Doty:  _____  Sager:  _____ 



Page 3 of 4 
 

EXHIBIT A 
 

A) That the following sections of the International Fire Code 2006 are amended as        
follows: 
  
903.2.1.1 Delete “12,000” and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.1 Insert “5,000” in place of deleted “12,000” 
903.2.1.2 Delete “5,000” and (455m²) 
903.2.1.2 Insert “2,500” in place of deleted “5,000” 
903.2.1.3 Delete “12,000” and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.3 Delete exception 
903.2.1.3 Insert “5,000” in place of deleted “12,000” 
903.2.1.4 Delete “12,000” and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.4 Delete exception 
903.2.1.4 Insert “5,000” in place of deleted “12,000” 
903.2.2 Delete “20,000” and (1858m²) 
903.2.2 Insert “5,000” in place of deleted “20,000” 
903.2.3 Delete “12,000” in place of (1115m²) and “24,000” and (2230m²) 
903.2.3 Insert “5,000” in place of the deleted “12,000” and insert “5,000” in place of 

the deleted “24,000” 
903.2.6 Delete “12,000” and (1115m²) and “24,000” and (2230m²) 
903.2.6 Insert “5,000” in place of the deleted “12,000” and insert “5,000” in place of 

the deleted “24,000” 
903.2.8 Deleted “12,000” and (1115m²) and “24,000” and (2230m²) 
903.2.8 Insert “5,000” in place of the deleted “12,000” and insert “5,000” in place of 

the deleted “24,000” 
903.2.8.1 Delete “10,000” and (929m²) and “12,000” and (1115m²) 
903.2.8.1 Insert “5,000” in place of the deleted “10,000” and insert “5,000” in place of 

the deleted “12,000 
903.2.13 Other required suppression systems; Insert Business Group B in excess 

of 5,000 sq. ft. 
903.4.2 Delete “audible” 
903.4.2 Insert “audio/visual” in place of “audible” 
903.4.2.1 Insert “alarm indicating appliances audio/visual devices shall be provided, 

seen and heard in all areas of every building.  All sprinklered buildings 
shall be provided with audio/visual devices.   This will provide full 
Building notification.” 

903.6 Insert “Manual Pulls, A/V Detectors – Manual pulls, A/V, and  detectors to 
be on separate zones per floor.” 

903.7 Insert “Outside Access – An outside and inside access door to the 
sprinkler riser valve room and fire pump room shall be provided.” 

903.8 Insert “separate fire pump room – A two (2) hour separate sprinkler valve 
room and/or fire pump room shall be provided.” 

903.9 Insert “FD Connections – All fire department connections shall be  a 5” 
Storz connection.” 

903.10 Insert “NFPA 231 – General Storage, 1998 edition.” 



Page 4 of 4 
 

903.11 Insert “NFPA 231 C- Rack Storage, 1998 edition.” 
903.12 Insert 231 D – Storage of rubber tires, 1998 edition” 
905.2 Suppression Systems – Installation Standards as it references NFPA 14 – 

subsections 6.3.5.4 & 6.3.5.4.1 delete “30.5m (100 ft)” 
905.2 As it references NFPA 14 – subsections 6.3.5.4 & 6.3.5.4.1 insert 75 ft. 
 
B)   Where Building Code is more restrictive the lower number shall apply. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


