
VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 1 of 13 
 

 
There is hereby adopted by the Village of Pecatonica for the purposes of establishing 
rules and regulations for all types of construction the following building codes which 
have been adopted as reference thereto the same as if fully set forth herein and the 
whole thereof, save and such portions as are hereinafter deleted or amended, one copy 
of which is on file in the office of the Village of Pecatonica.  The Village of Pecatonica 
Building Codes shall conform to the following: 

 
NEC 2008  National Electrical Code and Amendments 
 
IRC 2006  International Residential Code and Amendments 
 
IBC 2006  International Building Code and Amendments 
 
IFC 2006  International Fire Code and Amendments 
 
IMC 2006  International Mechanical Code and Amendments 
 
IECC 2009  International Energy Conservation Code 
 
IFGC 2006  International Fuel Gas Code 
 
IEBC 2006  International Existing Building Code 
 
NFPA 101  2003 Life Safety Code 
 
IDPH 2004 Illinois Plumbing Code and Amendments 
 
Illinois Accessibility Code 
 
 

 

AMENDMENTS FOLLOW 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 2 of 13 
 

The following sections of the International Building Code 2006 are amended as 
follows: 
903.2.1.1 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²). 
903.2.1.1 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.2.1.2 Delete ―5,000‖ and (455m²). 
903.2.1.2 Insert ―2,500‖ in place of the deleted ―5,000.‖ 
903.2.1.3 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²). 
903.2.1.3 Delete exception 
903.2.1.3 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.2.1.4 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.4 Delete exception 
903.2.1.4 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.2.2 Delete ―20,000‖ and (1858m²) 
903.2.2 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―20,000‖ 
903.2.3 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) and ―24,000‖ and (2230m²).  
903.2.3 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―24,000‖  
903.2.6 Deleted ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) and ―24,000‖ and (2230m²) 
903.2.6 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―24,000‖ 
903.2.8 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) and ―24,000‖ and (2230m²) 
903.2.8 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―24,000‖ 
903.2.8.1 Deleted ―10,000‖ and (929m²) and ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) 
903.2.8.1 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―10,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.4.2 Deleted ―audible‖ 
903.4.2 Insert ―audio/visual‖ in place of ―audible‖ 
903.4.2.1 Insert ―Alarm indicating appliances audio/visual devices shall be provided, 

seen and heard in all areas of every building.  All sprinklered buildings 
shall be provided with audio/visual devices.  This will provide full building 
notification.‖ 

903.6 Insert ―Manual Pulls/A/V, Detectors – Manual pulls, A/V, and detectors to 
be on separate zones per floor.‖ 

903.7 Insert ―Outside Access – An outside and inside access door to the 
sprinkler riser valve room and the fire pump room shall be provided.‖ 

903.8 Insert ―Separated Fire Pump Room – A two (2) hour separate sprinkler 
valve room and/or fire pump room shall be provided.‖ 

903.9 Insert ―FD Connections – Industrial occupancy buildings that have large 
sprinkler systems or fire protection demands, shall provide a 5‖ Storz fire 
department connection.‖ 

903.10 Insert ―NFPA 231 – General Storage, 1998 edition.‖ 
903.11 Insert ―NFPA 231 C – Rack Storage, 1998 edition.‖ 
903.12 Insert NFPA 231 D – Storage of rubber tires, 1998 edition.‖ 
905.2 Suppression Systems – Installation Standards as it references NFPA 14 – 

subsections 6.3.5.4 & 6.3.5.4.1 delete ―30.5m (100ft)‖ 
905.2 As it references NFPA 14 – subsections 6.3.5.4 & 6.3.5.4.1 insert 75 ft. 
B)    Where Building Code is more restrictive, the lower number shall apply. 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 3 of 13 
 

The following sections of the ICC International Residential Code, 2006 Edition, are 
amended to read as follows: 
 
R309.2 Separation Required. The garage shall be separated from the residence and 

its attic area by not less than 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) type X fire-rated gypsum board 
applied to the garage side. Where the separation is a floor—ceiling assembly, the 
structure supporting the separation shall also be protected by not less than 5/8 
inch (15.9 mm) type X fire-rated gypsum board or equivalent. 

 2. Effect of sign regulations. In the event of conflict between this section and the 
Village of Pecatonica Code of Ordinances pertaining to building street number 
signs, the provisions of this section shall control. 

 

R801.3 Roof Drainage/Gutters and Downspouts. Roofs of all buildings shall have the 
means of concentrating storm water. Residential downspouts not connected to 
the storm sewer shall discharge directly onto splash blocks located no closer to 
the abutting property line than one-half the overall distance as measured 
between the building and the abutting property line. The discharged water shall 
not be allowed to flow across walking or driving surfaces. When the point of 
discharge is located within 5 feet (1524 mm) from the abutting property line, the 
discharge pipe shall be directed to the front or rear of the property. If his can not 
be achieved, the downspouts shall be directly connected to a storm sewer. The 
Village, or its authorized designee, may vary the requirements of this section if 
warranted by site conditions.  

 
Section R328 is created and approved to read as follows: 

SECTION R328 ACCESSORY STRUCTURES 

R328.1 Storage Sheds.  All sheds shall be securely anchored either to a 
foundation or to the ground.  Anchoring to the ground shall be 
accomplished by means of metal ground screws, metal stakes, treated 
wood stakes, or other approved methods. 

 

Section R329 is created and approved to read as follows: 

SECTION R329 WINDOW WELL COVERS 

R329 (J) Window Well Covers. All window wells shall have a protective cover 
capable of supporting a 250 lb. (113.5 kg.) load, to prevent people and 
animals from falling into the well. Window well covers for emergency 
escape and rescue openings shall be installed in accordance with Section 
R310. 

 
Added to section R311.4.1 

 
R311.4.1a. All exit doors and patio doors must have temporary or permanently 

installed steps on the exterior in order to get final occupancy. 
 Only one exception, where patio, or exit door is six (6) foot off final grade, 

than door or patio door must be securely secured shut. 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 4 of 13 
 

The 2008 Edition of the National Electrical Code as previously adopted by the Village 
is amended as follows: 
 
(1)  Definitions:  

 
a. Metal Conduit shall mean one of the following: Electrical Metallic Tubing 

(Type EMT) or Rigid Metal Conduit (Type RMC) or Intermediate Metal 
Conduit (Type IMC).  Flexible Metal Conduit (Type FMC) shall be used in 
exposed and concealed locations in lengths not in excess of six (6) feet for 
any use. 

 
(2) Electrical Service:  

 
a. Residential new service shall be in metal conduit.  

 
b.    Commercial or industrial new service shall be in metal conduit.  

 
c. Apartments, duplexes, townhouses, condos and multi-family new      

service and sub-panels shall be in metal conduit.  
 
d.  Minimum service shall be comprised of 100 amperage and a 16 circuit 

breaker cabinet with 100 amperage main breaker. 
 
e. Service on pole or outside run to the main cabinet or sub-cabinet shall 

have a main breaker or disconnect inside at the cabinet. 
 
f. All service shall have, at a minimum; two separate eight (8) foot ground 

rods placed at least six (6) feet apart.  Ground wires shall come out from 
the bottom of the meter base and connect to ground rod with ground 
clamps.  Ground wires shall go to terminal at the meter socket and into 
terminal in the breaker panel. Bonding bushings shall be required around 
concentric or eccentric knockouts. 

 
g. Ground clamps shall be six (6) inches above grade. 
 
h.  All service shall be grounded to a metallic cold water pipe and to a 

supplementary electrode.  Water meters shall require a bonding jumper. 
 
i.  Minimum 100 amperage service shall be #3 copper and 1 ¼‖ conduit for 

single and multi-family units. 
 
j. Minimum 200 amperage service shall be #3 copper and 2‖ conduit for 

single and multi-family units. 
 
k. Commercial and industrial new services may be either aluminum or 

copper conductors. 
 
l.  The minimum breaker panel size for 200 amperage service shall be 30 

spaces. 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 5 of 13 
 

 
m. The use of tandem and mini breakers in new and remodeled single and 

multi-family units shall have no more than two tandem or mini breakers 
installed in a breaker panel. 

 
n. New multi-family units, condos, townhouses, and apartments shall be   in 

metal conduit.   
 
o. At no time shall aluminum wire ever be used in single and multi-family 

units. 
 
p. New homes under construction with an area greater than 1,600 square 

feet shall have a minimum service rating of 200 amperages. New homes 
under construction with an area greater than 3,800 square feet of finished 
area, not including garages, shall have a minimum service rating of 400 
amperages. 

 
q. Homes being remolded shall have the square footage reevaluated by 

authorized Village personnel to determine if the service size shall be 
changed to accommodate any change in finished area. If a change in 
service size is determined to be necessary, the size of service shall 
conform to the standards for new homes. 

 
(3) Type of wiring:  

 
a. All wiring in new (or remodeled) single-family dwellings shall be in Romex 

with a bare conductor for equipment ground if they want.  
 

b. All wiring in basements and garages shall be in conduit. 
 

c. The use of metal staples is prohibited. 
 

d. In basement, and garages exposed wiring to be in conduit. 
 

e. No stacking of more than two #14/2, 14/3,-12/2, 12/3,-10/. The use of 
stackers is required for Romex. 

 
f. All wiring in metal buildings and metal sheds shall be done in conduit. 
 
g. All wiring in commercial, farm, agricultural and industrial buildings shall be 

in metal conduit. 
 
h. The use of electrical nonmetallic tubing (ENT) shall be prohibited in 

commercial, residential and industrial buildings.  The use of metal clad 
cable shall be prohibited in all applications including but not limited to 
commercial, residential, and industrial buildings. 

 
i. Armor cable may be used subject to pre-approval by authorized Village 

officials or their designee. 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 6 of 13 
 

 
j. All switches, devices and fixtures shall be rated according to conductor 

size.   All commercial and industrial outlets shall be 20-amperage rated. 
 
k. All garage receptacles shall be on a 20-amperage separate circuit with 20-

amperage GFI rated receptacles. 
 
l.  Refrigerator, freezer or central vacuum shall be on a single, non-GFI   

rated, receptacle. 
 
m.  Laundry equipment and sump pumps shall be on a single, non-GFI rated, 

receptacle. 
 
n. Conductor Terminations.  Termination at permanently installed wiring 

devices shall be at one of the binding head screw, screw tightened clamp 
type, set screw, or manually torque hardware. Premises wiring methods 
utilized for component interconnection, box dimensions, and enclosures 
shall not be allowed in dwelling occupancies.  Surface wiring methods 
listed and otherwise approved by the National Electrical Code may be 
allowed. Splices and taps shall be installed by methods in compliance with 
provisions of Article 110 and other applicable articles of the National 
Electrical Code.  
 

(4) Circuits and required outlets:  
 

a. Number of Openings.  The following standards shall apply: 
 
i. For 15 amperage circuits: #14 gauge wire, a maximum of 8 

openings, and all lights and outlets shall be on 15 amperage 
breaker. 

ii. For 20 amperage circuit: #12 gauge wire, a maximum of 10 
openings, and all lights and outlets shall be on 20 amperage 
breaker. 
 

b. There shall be install a minimum of one (1) wall switch to control the light 
outlet in every room, hallways, stairways, garage and outdoor entrance. 

 
c. All circuits shall be identified in the cabinet.  

 
(5) Splices and connections:  

 
a. All wires shall be twisted and mechanically secured with wire nuts. 
 
b. All Romex shall be stripped before put in boxes. 
 
c. No more than two (2) wires shall be allowed on each receptacle. 
 
d. Joints shall be created for rough-in inspection.  

 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 7 of 13 
 

(6) Laundry:  
 

a.  Receptacle to be a 20 amperage device on a 20 amperage circuit. 
 

(7) Kitchen:  
 

a. Lighting shall be on one (1) circuit, the dishwasher shall be on one 
(1) circuit, receptacles shall be on two (2) 20 amperage circuits.  
Receptacles shall be rated 20 amperage.  

 
b. A receptacle shall be installed on each counter space that is nine 

(9) inches or wider. 
 
c.  Microwaves shall be on a separate, 20 amperage circuit.  

 
(8) Garage: 

 
a. All walls, finished or unfinished, in a garage shall have a minimum of two 

(2) 20 amperage, GFI rated, receptacles. 
 

(9) Closets:  
 

a. All closets less than three (3) foot in depth shall have approved closet 
fixtures if a light is to be installed.  
 

(10)  Ground-fault circuit:  
 

 NOTE:  Outside outlet shall be required to be adjacent to patio doors.  
 
 NOTE:  All GFI outlets shall be identified as GFI outlets. GFI receptacles shall be 

required to be within five (5) feet of any sink or laundry tub area.  This includes all 
single-family, multi-family, commercial and industrial applications.  

 
(11)  Boxes:  

 
a. Wiring device boxes shall have sufficient cubic inches to house the 

wires installed within the box. 
 
b. All ceiling boxes shall be ceiling fan approved. 
 
c. Boxes shall be required in the dining room, living room, kitchen, family 

room, offices, bedrooms, and all habitable rooms of all residential dwelling 
units. 

         
 NOTE:  All metal boxes shall have green screw. 
 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 8 of 13 
 

 
(12)  Bathroom emergency lights:  

 
a. All bathrooms, accessible to the public, in commercial and industrial 

buildings shall have emergency lights installed. 
  
 NOTE:  No outlets or switches shall be located in designated bathtub or shower 

zones. Designated bathtub and shower zones shall be the area measuring 3 foot 
horizontally and 8 foot vertically from the top of the bathtub rim or shower stall 
threshold. 

 
(13)  Water pump, furnace and air conditioner:  
 

a. All furnaces and air conditioners shall have a disconnect switch. 
 
b. All water pumps shall have disconnect switch, if the water pump is not in 

the same room as breaker panel or is over twelve (12) feet from the panel. 
 

(14)  Miscellaneous:  
      

a. All homes under construction shall have addressees and/or lot numbers 
visible to inspectors from the road at all times. 

 
b. Electrical contractors shall have available addresses and lot number 

identified on the service at the time of installation.  The address, lot 
number, and the contractor’s name and phone number shall be on the 
meter sockets and break panels. 

 
c. All recessed lights shall be IC or double housing type when covered by 

insulation. 
                   
(15)  Mobile homes:  
 

a. The connection from the distribution panels in a mobile home to the 
power source shall be made with proper conduit, which has been 
approved by the Village or its authorized designee.  

 
b. All electrical in mobile homes shall be approved by authorized Village 

officials before occupancy. 
 

(16)  Smoke alarms:  
 

a. Smoke alarms shall be installed in hallways, basement areas, all levels of 
a dwelling and in all bedrooms and sleeping areas. 

 
b. Smoke alarms shall be hardwired 120 volt interconnected with battery 

backup. 
 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 9 of 13 
 

c.  The provisions of this paragraph 18 shall apply to all new construction or 
remodeling of residential, multi-family, townhouses and apartment units. 

 
d. Commercial and industrial buildings shall have smoke alarm systems or 

hardwired 120 volt interconnected battery backup smoke detectors. 
 
e. Heat alarms:  Heat alarms shall be installed in attached garages. 
 
f. Carbon Monoxide Detectors: A carbon monoxide detector, interconnecting 

with battery backup, shall be installed on every floor, in common hallways 
and basements. These detectors shall be installed in accordance with 
manufactures instructions.   

 
(17)   Emergency Lights: 
 

a. All new and existing multi-family dwellings, apartments, commercial 
buildings and industrial building shall have emergency light and exit light 
installed where deemed necessary by the authorized Village officials or 
their designees. 

 
(18)   Inspections: 
 

a.   Requests for electrical inspections of new construction shall be made by 
the electrical contractor.  The electrical contractor shall provide the 
electrical inspector with the address and/or lot number of the dwelling to 
be inspected.  The following three (3) electrical inspections shall, at a 
minimum, be required: 

 
i. Service Inspection.  No requests for service inspection shall be 

made unless backfill is in area of meter.  In the event there is no 
backfill in the area of the meter, the electrical inspector shall not 
perform a service inspection and the lack of backfill shall be 
deemed an incomplete installation requiring an additional 
inspection pursuant to subsection (b) below.   

 
ii. Rough-In Inspection. 
 
iii. Final before Occupancy Inspection. 

 
b. Additional inspections.  When additional inspections are required as a 

result of incomplete installation or as a result of continuing violations, an 
additional inspection fee shall be charged. Each additional inspection shall 
require a fee of $75.00.  All fees must be paid to the Village before re-
inspections will be performed.                                 

 
  c. Defective conditions:  Where installation of any wiring or electrical devices 

or material is found to be in a dangerous or unsafe condition the electrical 
inspector shall at once notify, in writing, the person, firm, or corporation 
owning, using, or operating the same, specifying wherein the same is 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 10 of 13 
 

dangerous or unsafe and such person, firm, or corporation shall, within the 
time specific in such notice make such repairs or changes as may be 
necessary to place such wiring, devices, and material in a safe condition.  

 
(19)   Existing residences:  
 

a.  Electric service: Existing electric services shall be a minimum of one 
hundred (100) amperage, two hundred forty (240) volt, three-wire with 
distribution panel and wiring properly installed and protected.  Main 
disconnect and over-current protective devices shall be accessible to each 
resident.  All over-current devices such as fuses or beakers shall be used 
to protect branch circuit conductors.  All panels shall be dead front. 

 
b.  Service grounding:  When grounding is on the house side of the water 

meter, the jumper shall be installed around water meter.  
 
c.      Electric wiring and facilities:  No dwelling or dwelling units shall be 

deemed to comply with the requirements of this ordinance relating to 
electrical wiring and facilities unless: 

 
i. Exposed wire.  Every exposed wire has insulation which is in good 

condition. 
ii. Switch and outlet plate.  Every switch and outlet plate is properly 

fastened in position. 
iii. Short circuit.  No short circuit or breaks exists in any electrical lines. 
iv. Fixtures.  Every fixture and outlet functions properly and is fastened 

in place. 
v. Shock hazard.  No obvious shock hazard exists as determined by 

authorized Village officials. 
vi. Temporary wiring.  No temporary wiring is used, except cords 

which run directly from portable electric fixtures to convenience 
outlets, and which do not lie beneath floor covering materials, 
pierce walls or extend through doorways, transoms, or other similar 
apertures through structural elements. 

vii. Overload.  No electrical circuit is overloaded as a result of 
connecting appliances which operate at high wattage to outlets 
supplied with wire of adequate size. 

viii. Exposed non-current metal parts.  All exposed non-current metal 
parts for the electrical system that are within eight (8) feet vertically 
or five (5) horizontally of ground or grounded metal object subject to 
contact by persons are grounded. 

ix. Exposed tube wiring.  There shall be no exposed knob and tube 
wiring in basements, garages, and walk-in attic areas.   

x. Maintenance in good condition.  Every outlet and fixture shall be 
properly maintained in good and safe condition, and shall be 
connected to an electrical power source in safe condition. 

xi. Hall and stairway lighting.  All halls and stairways in multi-family 
dwellings containing five (5) or more dwelling units shall be 
adequately lighted at all times.  Every hallway and stairway in 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 11 of 13 
 

structures devoted solely to dwelling occupancy and containing not 
more than four (4) dwelling units shall be supplied with conveniently 
located light switches, controlling an adequate lighting system 
which may be turned on when needed, instead of full-time lighting. 

xii. Wall switches.  All habitable rooms shall have a wall switch to 
control a light or a receptacle outlet. Stairways from one living level 
to another shall have three-way switches at each level.  A wall 
switch for permanently mounted light shall be installed at all exterior 
doorway entrances. Wall switch(s) shall be installed for attic 
stairway and basement stairway lights.  Wall switches and 
permanently installed lights shall be installed in dining rooms, 
kitchens, and bathrooms. 

xiii. Light fixtures.  Permanently installed light fixtures shall be installed 
in utility rooms, over laundry tubs, in the area of electric panel(s), 
and in any other areas requiring general illumination.  Permanently 
installed light fixtures, to be controlled by wall switch(s) shall be 
installed in dining rooms, kitchens, hallways, stairways and 
bathrooms. 

xiv. Convenience of receptacle outlets.  In all habitable rooms, a 
minimum of two (2) duplex wall receptacles shall be installed, each 
on opposite walls. 

 In living rooms, recreation rooms, and family rooms, a minimum of 
three (3) duplex wall receptacles shall be installed, each on 
separate walls. 

 In bathrooms, one wall mounted receptacle shall be installed 
adjacent to the sink on G.F.C.I.  Receptacle outlets shall not be 
installed within or adjacent to a shower or bathtub space. 

 In kitchens, a minimum of three (3) wall receptacles shall be 
installed, two (2) receptacles to be accessible at all times. 

 One (1) receptacle shall be installed within six (6) feet of laundry 
tubs. 

 Receptacle outlets installed in basements, garages, open porches, 
breezeways, or other locations used by person standing on the 
ground or on grounding conductive materials shall be installed on a 
grounded system and shall be G.F.C.I. protected.  No receptacle, 
unless in an approved box, shall be installed in the floor. 



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 12 of 13 
 

The 2004 Illinois Plumbing Code is amended as follows: 
 
A.   All plumbing from the property line to the building has to be done by an Illinois 

Licensed Plumber. 
 
B.  All plumbing systems and equipment shall be installed in accordance with the 

Illinois State Plumbing Code as adopted by the Village of Pecatonica including 
local amendments. All work shall be performed by State of Illinois licensed 
plumbers in accordance with the Plumbing License Act. 

 
C.  Water Service: Water service connection from the cutoff (buffalo box) to the valve 

after the meter shall be installed by a State of Illinois Licensed and Bonded 
Plumbing Contractor only. Home owners shall not be allowed to install water 
service.  



VILLAGE OF PECATONICA 
BUILDING CODES 

 

Page 13 of 13 
 

 
The following sections of the International Fire Code 2006 are amended as follows: 
903.2.1.1 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.1 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.2.1.2 Delete ―5,000‖ and (455m²) 
903.2.1.2 Insert ―2,500‖ in place of deleted ―5,000‖ 
903.2.1.3 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.3 Delete exception 
903.2.1.3 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.2.1.4 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) 
903.2.1.4 Delete exception 
903.2.1.4 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of deleted ―12,000‖ 
903.2.2 Delete ―20,000‖ and (1858m²) 
903.2.2 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of deleted ―20,000‖ 
903.2.3 Delete ―12,000‖ in place of (1115m²) and ―24,000‖ and (2230m²) 
903.2.3 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―24,000‖ 
903.2.6 Delete ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) and ―24,000‖ and (2230m²) 
903.2.6 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―24,000‖ 
903.2.8 Deleted ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) and ―24,000‖ and (2230m²) 
903.2.8 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―12,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―24,000‖ 
903.2.8.1 Delete ―10,000‖ and (929m²) and ―12,000‖ and (1115m²) 
903.2.8.1 Insert ―5,000‖ in place of the deleted ―10,000‖ and insert ―5,000‖ in place of 

the deleted ―12,000 
903.2.13 Other required suppression systems; Insert Business Group B in excess 

of 5,000 sq. ft. 
903.4.2 Delete ―audible‖ 
903.4.2 Insert ―audio/visual‖ in place of ―audible‖ 
903.4.2.1 Insert ―alarm indicating appliances audio/visual devices shall be provided, 

seen and heard in all areas of every building.  All sprinklered buildings 
shall be provided with audio/visual devices.   This will provide full 
Building notification.‖ 

903.6 Insert ―Manual Pulls, A/V Detectors – Manual pulls, A/V, and  detectors to 
be on separate zones per floor.‖ 

903.7 Insert ―Outside Access – An outside and inside access door to the 
sprinkler riser valve room and fire pump room shall be provided.‖ 

903.8 Insert ―separate fire pump room – A two (2) hour separate sprinkler valve 
room and/or fire pump room shall be provided.‖ 

903.9 Insert ―FD Connections – All fire department connections shall be  a 5‖ 
Storz connection.‖ 

903.10 Insert ―NFPA 231 – General Storage, 1998 edition.‖ 
903.11 Insert ―NFPA 231 C- Rack Storage, 1998 edition.‖ 
903.12 Insert 231 D – Storage of rubber tires, 1998 edition‖ 
905.2 Suppression Systems – Installation Standards as it references NFPA 14 – 

subsections 6.3.5.4 & 6.3.5.4.1 delete ―30.5m (100 ft)‖ 
905.2 As it references NFPA 14 – subsections 6.3.5.4 & 6.3.5.4.1 insert 75 ft. 
B)   Where Building Code is more restrictive the lower number shall apply. 


